
The First Indian Solo Circumnavigation Under
Sail Making Waves
In the world of sailing, achieving a solo circumnavigation is no small feat. It
requires unparalleled determination, skill, and endurance to navigate the
treacherous waters of the world's oceans alone. And while many sailors have
attempted this daunting challenge, only a select few have successfully completed
it. One such sailor, making waves and rewriting history, is Indian Navy officer
Commander Abhilash Tomy.

Commander Abhilash Tomy's ambitious journey began on November 1, 2012,
when he set sail from Mumbai's Gateway of India on his yacht named "Thuriya."
The 56-foot boat aptly named after a constellation in the Indian celestial sphere
was Commander Tomy's home for the next 151 days, as he set out on a
remarkable adventure that would make India proud.

The Indian Navy had a long-standing tradition of sailing, but no Indian had ever
attempted a solo circumnavigation under sail before Commander Tomy. The
challenge was daunting, with unpredictable weather patterns, heavy storms, and
vast stretches of unforgiving seas to navigate. But armed with his extensive
sailing experience and unwavering determination, Commander Tomy was ready
to take on this herculean task.
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As he embarked on his journey, the world watched with bated breath. The
expedition was fraught with dangers, as Commander Tomy battled massive
waves, powerful gusts of wind, and the crippling isolation that comes with being
alone at sea for months on end. But throughout the ups and downs, he never
wavered in his pursuit to become the first Indian sailor to achieve this remarkable
feat.
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On his journey, Commander Tomy encountered numerous challenges. One of the
most significant obstacles came in the form of a massive storm in the Indian
Ocean. Winds reached speeds of up to 150 km/h, and waves towered above his
yacht. Despite his best efforts to navigate the treacherous conditions, disaster
struck when a huge wave overturned his boat.

In what can only be described as a testament to his resilience, Commander Tomy
managed to retrieve his emergency satellite phone before his yacht sank. It was
through this critical communication device that he was able to call for help and
stay afloat until rescue teams arrived. His survival in these extreme conditions
showcased his sheer determination and unwavering spirit.

Commander Tomy's incredible journey captured the attention of millions
worldwide. People were captivated by his bravery, strength, and sheer willpower.
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News outlets across the globe documented his progress, providing regular
updates on his whereabouts and condition. The Indian Navy also closely
monitored his expedition, providing support and ensuring his safety throughout
the journey.

The world breathed a collective sigh of relief when Commander Tomy was
rescued by a French fisheries patrol vessel after three long days adrift in the
ocean. His tale of survival against all odds garnered international acclaim, and he
was hailed as a true hero and a symbol of inspiration for millions.

While Commander Tomy's solo circumnavigation came to an unexpected end, his
legacy and impact continue to resonate. He proved that with unwavering
determination and the right skills, an individual can overcome any obstacle, no
matter how formidable. His journey has inspired a new generation of Indian
sailors to dream big and push the boundaries of what is possible.

The First Indian Solo Circumnavigation Under Sail Making Waves remains an
incredible achievement in the annals of sailing history. Commander Abhilash
Tomy's bravery, resilience, and unwavering determination have carved a special
place for him in the hearts of people across the globe. His story is a reminder that
human willpower and the pursuit of dreams can defy even the harshest of
conditions and leave a lasting legacy for generations to come.
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An engrossing narrative of one man’s struggle to achieve his dream against all
odds, this is both a fast-paced adventure and a telling commentary on how
heroes are often made despite the system they operate in, by dint of sheer
perseverance and commitment to a chosen path. Above all, it’s a paean to the
power of self-belief that serves to inspire, motivate and exhilarate. On 19 May
2010, as he sailed INSV Mhadei into Mumbai harbour, Commander Dilip Donde
earned his place in India’s maritime history by becoming the first Indian to
complete a solo circumnavigation under sail, south of the 3 Great Capes. The
feat, successfully completed by just over 200 people in the world, had never been
attempted in his country before. In his own words, the book chronicles his
progress over four years, from building a suitable boat with an Indian boat-
builder; weaving his way through the ‘sea-blind’ and often quixotic bureaucracy;
and training himself with no precedent or knowledge base in the country, to finally
sailing solo around the world. During this gruelling task he was mentored by Sir
Robin Knox-Johnston, the first man to sail solo non-stop around the world.
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